
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date: March 22, 2018 Name of Bidder
Time:  10:00 A..M.
Oil and Chip - Group III

Erienna Township
Section 18-03000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sq. Yd. 19,135 $0.80 $15,308.00 $0.85 $16,264.75 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gallon 6,697 $1.70 $11,384.90 $2.20 $14,733.40 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials HFP Gallon 13,969 $2.30 $32,128.70 $2.65 $37,017.85 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 239 $34.00 $8,126.00 $32.00 $7,648.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 210 $34.00 $7,140.00 $30.00 $6,300.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Fog Seal Sq. Yd. 19,135 $0.40 $7,654.00 $0.42 $8,036.70 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $81,741.60 $90,000.70 #VALUE!

Garfield Township
Section # 18-05000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Material HFP Gal 3,562 $2.33 $8,299.46 $2.70 $9,617.40 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 127 $35.00 $4,445.00 $30.00 $3,810.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $12,744.46 $13,427.40 #VALUE!

Goodfarm Township
Section 18-06000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sq. Yd. 93 $9.00 $837.00 $0.85 $79.05 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gallon 33 $1.70 $56.10 $2.50 $82.50 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials HFP Gallon 18,590 $2.30 $42,757.00 $2.65 $49,263.50 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 1 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 663 $31.00 $20,553.00 $30.00 $19,890.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Fog Seal Sq. Yd. 93 $2.50 $232.50 $0.42 $39.06 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $64,470.60 $69,389.11 #VALUE!

Highland Township
Section 18-09000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bituminous Materials HFP Gallon 7,714 $2.33 $17,973.62 $2.70 $20,827.80 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 275 $34.00 $9,350.00 $30.00 $8,250.00 No Bid #VALUE!

TOTAL $27,323.62 $29,077.80 #VALUE!

Maine Township
Section 18-10000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sq Yd 6,810 $0.87 $5,924.70 $0.85 $5,788.50 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gal 2,384 $1.70 $4,052.80 $2.20 $5,244.80 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Material HFP Gal 4,971 $2.33 $11,582.43 $2.70 $13,421.70 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 85 $35.00 $2,975.00 $33.00 $2,805.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 75 $35.00 $2,625.00 $30.00 $2,250.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $27,159.93 $29,510.00 #VALUE!
 
Mazon Township
Section 18-11000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sq Yd 5,931 $0.87 $5,159.97 $0.85 $5,041.35 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gal 2,076 $1.70 $3,529.20 $2.20 $4,567.20 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Material HFP Gal 5,580 $2.33 $13,001.40 $2.75 $15,345.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 74 $35.00 $2,590.00 $33.00 $2,442.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 110 $35.00 $3,850.00 $30.00 $3,300.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $28,130.57 $30,695.55 #VALUE!

Nettle Creek Township
Section 18-13000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Materials Hot Oil Gal 4,107 $2.33 $9,569.31 $2.75 $11,294.25 No Bid #VALUE!
Bit Materials HFP Gal 4,107 $2.33 $9,569.31 $2.75 $11,294.25 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Agg (5/8" Chips) Ton 147 $35.00 $5,145.00 $33.00 $4,851.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Agg Ton 129 $35.00 $4,515.00 $30.00 $3,870.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Fog Seal Sq. Yd. 11,733 $0.40 $4,693.20 $0.42 $4,927.86 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $33,491.82 $36,237.36 #VALUE!
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ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date: March 22, 2018 Name of Bidder
Time:  10:00 A..M.
Oil and Chip - Group III

Saratoga Township
Section 18-15000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sq Yd 8,225 $0.80 $6,580.00 $0.85 $6,991.25 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gal 2,879 $1.70 $4,894.30 $2.20 $6,333.80 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Material HFP Gal 7,232 $2.33 $16,850.56 $2.75 $19,888.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 103 $35.00 $3,605.00 $33.00 $3,399.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 134 $35.00 $4,690.00 $30.00 $4,020.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $36,619.86 $40,632.05 #VALUE!

Vienna Township
Section 18-16000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sq Yd 12,584 $0.80 $10,067.20 $0.85 $10,696.40 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gal 4,404 $1.70 $7,486.80 $2.20 $9,688.80 No Bid #VALUE!
Bituminous Material HFP Gal 16,618 $2.30 $38,221.40 $2.70 $44,868.60 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 157 $35.00 $5,495.00 $32.00 $5,024.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 403 $33.00 $13,299.00 $30.00 $12,090.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $74,569.40 $82,367.80 #VALUE!

Grundy County
Section 18-00000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Materials Hot Oil Gal 3,494 $2.33 $8,141.02 $2.70 $9,433.80 No Bid #VALUE!
Bit Materials HFP Gal 13,705 $2.30 $31,521.50 $2.65 $36,318.25 No Bid #VALUE!
Cover Coat Agg (5/8" Chips) Ton 125 $35.00 $4,375.00 $33.00 $4,125.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Seal Coat Agg Ton 475 $33.00 $15,675.00 $30.00 $14,250.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Fog Seal Sq. Yd. 39,156 $0.40 $15,662.40 $0.42 $16,445.52 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL $75,374.92 $80,572.57 #VALUE!
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