ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date: March 22, 2018
Time: 10:00 A..M.
FOB - Group IIA
Grundy County Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-00000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 10,000 $6.25 $62,500.00 | $5.95 $59,500.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Goodfarm Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-06000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 1,000 $6.25 $6,250.00 $5.95 $5,950.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Greenfield Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-08000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 2,144 $6.25 $13,400.00 | $5.95 $12,756.80 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Highland Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-09000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 2,000 $6.25 $12,500.00 | $5.95 $11,900.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Maine Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-10000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 300 $6.25 $1,875.00 $5.95 $1,785.00 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Mazon Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-11000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 2,590 $6.25 $16,187.50 | $5.95 $15,410.50 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Nettle Creek Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-13000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 510 $6.25 $3,187.50 $5.95 $3,034.50 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Nettle Creek Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-13000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
RR-3, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 414 $20.00 $8,280.00 $5.95 $2,463.30 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Saratoga Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-15000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 1,805 $6.25 $11,281.25 | $5.95 $10,739.75 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL
Vienna Township Central Limestone LaFarge Aggregates Vulvcan Materials
Section # 18-16000-00-GM

ITEMS UNIT Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
CA-6, Loaded on Truck FOB Pit or Quarry Ton 1,534 $6.25 $9,587.50 $5.95 $9,127.30 No Bid #VALUE!
TOTAL




